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San’a’ke o Da Pahdasan’ka Barak Solarys San o Da Pahdasan Kalynda San o Da 
Akeyan’shi, honoleia i imzaia’e 


Welcome to this moment, the power, presence, and potential of which is, indeed, infinite. 


I am Da Pah Kwan Yin San, and it is my great joy and my honor, as always, to spend this 
next period of time with you, to focus on that, which is real, on that, which is Love, and to 
focus on the reality and the presence of the creator self that you, indeed, are. Within you 
and surrounding you at all time. 


A State of Love and Simplicity

Before we commence today’s class, and we enter into ascension tuition, I would like to 
invite you to take a brief moment together of equal infinity and equal presence, of course, 
so that we can align ourselves and focus ourselves on those things that we will be 
discussing together. 


So, if you would take a moment to close your eyes or to focus on a single point for a brief 
minute and to become aware of your head and the presence around your head, the sphere 
around your head that is the head kakra, the Akonai’da. 


This sphere, which in itself is a holographic reflection of the Akene, of the heart space, has 
been discussed many times in previous classes. But for now, I would like you to focus on 
this sphere around your head and to fill it up in front you, right in front of you, with the 
energy and the presence of Love, Da. And right behind you to fill it up with the presence of 
Joy, Ba. And behind you, on the left, to fill up the sphere of the head kakra with Freedom, 
Va. And on the left in front of you, to fill it up by focusing on Truth, Ra. 


As you do this, you will notice that this flow begins to find an access point through all four 
quadrants of the head kakra, and to go straight from this Ra point into the heart center, 
where it activates Ka, life force energy. 


Do you feel that? Do you feel that this simple exercise that you can do at any point in your 
day: in your bed before you rise; on the toilet before you go back into your meetings or 
what have you; or simply in an unattended moment in a park or on a tram. You can do this 
at any time. Simply by focusing on the presence of these San ingredients of Love, Joy, 
Freedom, Truth, and Life, you automatically open up a space within yourself that is a 
space of Gratitude, which is an ingredient, if you will, that exists within the heart kakra. And 
that Gratitude will lead to Grace. And that state of Grace, where all things are equalized in 
Love and beyond, ultimately, accesses a point within you, deep within your heart, that is a 
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state of Vish, or in other words, Wellbeing. A word that in English has been given a lot of 
meanings over the years but, truly, a state of Wellbeing is a state that invokes all these 
other states that we have just gone through, all these other ingredients of San. 


If you charge yourself and fill yourself up from within with these energies on a constant and 
continuous basis, then the outside reality, as I have taught you before, of course, also 
undergoes a change. Because in the concept of reality creation, every single event, 
person, place, every single atom, every single bit of energy that exists as it appears 
outside of you, no matter which states it expresses, a state of negativity even or a state of 
pain or whatever that might be confrontational is, ultimately, inverted San ingredients. So, 
by becoming more aware of these states in your kakra system at all times and to hold 
them there I would say… But what I should say, is to continue to be present with them 
because they are always there. So, it is more state of awareness than a state of focus, 
really. By being aware of these energies and these ingredients within your own system, 
you will automatically start to see the inverted versions thereof in the form of fear, and you 
can uncouple it, unpack it, and go back to a state of Love. 


This is the simplicity of all of the Imzaia material, truly, and of all ascension tuition. And 
without applying that particular simplicity, the rest of the work, as it has been presented 
throughout the years and the decades, the Imzaia Material, but also work previously done 
in other bodies than this one, of course, can become rather complex. And that is because 
it is not observed from within the simplicity within the self, you see. 


And the same, of course, goes for other things in life, not just the Imzaia Material, but, 
ultimately, every single thing in life. When observed as complexity, it simply means that 
you have not found simplicity within yourself. And, therefore, in other terms, your filter is 
off. 


This is what this simple exercise can remind you of and can bring you back to at any point 
in the day. And I would even invite you to become aware that working with these exercises 
will also have the ability to change the thought process itself so that inverted thoughts of 
‘bizarrity’, if you will, negativity, fear, and unconscious tension or friction, can be unpacked 
for what they truly are. 


Now, I wanted to start this particular class reminding you of this exercise because it has 
been a few months since we have spoken in this fashion together directly. And, of course, I 
hope that in these months you have been focusing, working with the previous material, 
and if so… and if any questions would have arisen for you, then you are always welcome 
to contact me and ask them so that I can incorporate them into these classes going 
forward. 
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The Journey of the Imzaia Material

But as you put your focus and awareness back on these San ingredients, before we get 
into the rest of today’s class where we will pick up where we left off with previous classes, I 
would like to take a little walk with you, if you will, down memory lane. I want to take you 
back several years, even into the previous decade. So, it is not a history lesson at large, if 
you will, but simply a little browsing through history, mainly focused on the Imzaia Material 
because I want you to understand that the material that has been presented in the form of 
what is now known as ‘The Study of Vibration’, and that now is continuing in the form of 
‘The Study of the Pah’, has had a very specific and very poignant unfolding. And this 
unfolding is not only something that, of course, happened in the Imzaia Material because, 
ultimately, the Imzaia Material, and especially The Study of Vibration, has been a very 
strong reflection of what you over the years as a student on the path of ascension has 
gone through. 


So, if you go back to a period in 2007 and 2008, then you will see that, initially, at that 
point, the Imzaia Material taught you about the arrival of new energy on planet Earth, and 
also free energy, as new energy developed into free energy. And this free energy was 
taught to you in the form of the triangle that Da Pah Ekara San spoke of in so many 
different ways. A triangle made up of a geotrinity of Love, Joy, and Freedom. 


Now, the arrival of that energy is not something that was only a mere cosmic event that 
was tied into the solar bodies, such as the galactic Sun and the solar Sun, for instance, 
and other solar bodies like it in the galaxy, but it had mainly to do, of course, with an 
opening up within the human heart that had been closed down for quite some time before 
that moment in time. 


As this free energy made its way back into human consciousness, we move forward from 
2007 and 2008 into 2009, which was a very interesting year on a human evolution, 
consciousness evolution level because at that point, the free energy construct, or de-
constructor I should say, had deconstructed the human mind, which was truly, at that point 
and in the years going before it, a type of hive mind, of personality, you could almost say, 
where it was extremely difficult to be, for instance, a free thinker or an original thinker. The 
focus was extremely hardly there to do so, and humans were constantly pulled into group 
thinking, if you will. Whether that was based on clans or based on countries or based on 
social preferences, it doesn’t matter, but it was certainly there. 
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Release of Mass Personality

But in 2009, around the period of April and slightly before that, a ‘release of mass 
personality’ as it was called by Da Jeshua San at the time, occurred. And it was probably 
not very well understood at the time because most people, when the students were going 
through the experience at the time, very strongly believed that it would be the end of their 
personality as they knew it, even though teachers, such as Da Kuthumi San, were clearly 
teaching at that period in time about the coming home of the personality to the self. He 
would speak about the fact that you, human, have a hole in your mind and in your heart 
and in your belly, and that this hole, with the return of personality, is being filled up again to 
completion. 


So, what was being said at the time, truly, was that you could almost think of it that all of 
humanity’s original personalities, and the free will with which those personalities would 
have developed, were until 2009 very strongly locked into some sort of grid, if you will, of 
suspended animation almost. Suspended animation in the sense that it was again very 
difficult to try and make your own path. And even if you did, those paths were strongly still 
influenced by the same type of hive mind whisper. 


I know this sounds a little extreme, but I am trying to describe larger experiences in very 
small words. So, bear with me for a second. 


So, after you have this gridlock of human personality, what truly happened in the release of 
mass personality is that this grid snapped, as it were. It was a huge storm all over Earth, in 
fact, that was noticed by many students at the time, as it would manifest in some form of 
physical event. And in those moments, humanity’s original personality templates returned 
to them, were set free, no longer as strongly as before connected to some sort of control 
grid. 


This was 2009. After this event happened in April of 2009, Da Pah Ekara San, together 
with Da Ojadasan’ka Adamus Valen San, and others, reintroduced to the student body the 
concept of the Ekaraia that we are all finding ourselves in, as it were, the concept of this 
universe. And he helped students remember, in many cases at least, that these had been 
bonds shared over lifetimes in what used to be called ‘Mystery Schools’, etc., and other 
types of educational centers throughout history, going all the way back to Egypt and many 
other places in time and space, and not necessarily all related the Earth experience either. 
Many of these experiences happened out of body in dreamtime states. 


But this is what Da Pah Ekara San and others reminded the student body of. And at that 
point, a lot of cosmic reconnections, information, such as the Ish Continuum, began to 
come through in very strong ways. 
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Ascension of All Matter

Now, all of this would eventually lead to a period in 2011, where in the Imzaia Material we 
describe this period as ‘The Ascension of All Matter’. Now, what you are seeing there, 
following from the release of mass personality in 2009, is that the un-gridlocked, 
reestablished personality has been able to return to the rest of you, as it were, and you are 
slowly beginning, at that point, to get a handle on what you are, who you are, what you 
want to do with yourself, and those sorts of things. 


And at that moment, Ascension of All Matter hits. What this, ultimately, describes, is the 
expressed reality outside of you in its own right being unlocked, un-gridlocked, no longer 
being as strict and constrictive as well as it once used to be. This goes all the way back to 
2011. That is when that particular expression of the external reality became more fluid, 
even though everything I am describing now until I get to the end of this part of the class, 
you might say, “It seems like today it has even gotten worse.” But I will get to that. 


So, if you are at that point where Ascension of All Matter has actually occurred, and the 
vibrational reality is no longer locked down, and the matrix concept, as we once knew it 
around here, is no longer active… Other presenters over the years, such as David Icke 
and many others, have taught about this. They have taught you about the Saturn matrix, 
and even in the classes of Imzaia this has been touched upon. We don’t need to go to too 
closely back into all of that, today at least. 


But anyway, at this point of Ascension of All Matter, it is also clearly explained to humans, 
students that are following the material at the time, that while it is true that the matrix 
concept, the gridlocked concept, if you will, is no longer active in the surrounding 
environment, it is clearly indicated at that point that the one place in which the so-called 
matrix still exists, is the human mind. Because don’t forget, of course, as I just showed you 
with the exercise at the beginning of this class, the human mind, and you yourself, are a 
generator of reality, a manifestor of reality. 


So, in other words, while the controls in 2011 were let go off to a large extent, you, as an 
individual within yourself, and as many individuals collectively, kept the same controls alive 
within your own mind. You became your own keeper, as it were, your own warden. You, at 
that point in time, started to hold the matrix concept in place yourself. 


A Spherical Container of Love

Now, that brings us a little bit further in time. That brings us to, for instance, 2012, where  
you begin to see Imzaia Consciousness teach classes, in which we begin to share with 
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you that – I remember the sentence pretty well – that ‘a spherical container of Love now 
surrounds everything’. And we spoke back then that every particle, whether it be an atom 
or a bit of energy; or whether it be an electron, or whether it be an organ, or whether it be a 
human body, or whether it would be a tool or an instrument or a house or a city itself, 
everything that is an object in its own, now expressed itself with a spherical container of 
love around it. 


And, of course, you hear me coming because what was addressed back then in 2012 is 
the return of San, and in this case the form of Da, Love, beginning to return as an 
expression around all things. 


So, now you can see that after the release of mass personality in 2009 and, ultimately, the 
Ascension of All Matter in 2011, where every single human being at that point had the 
ability to, ultimately, express a life beyond this matrix concept that in 2012 an interesting 
evolution happens because a number of humans, obviously, must have gotten to that 
point, as now the external reality, in fact, begins to respond to that. 


After this period in time, we go a few years ahead into 2015 and 2016, again very 
interesting years when it comes to the Imzaia Material. 


By 2015, and the Imzaia Crew and myself at that point find ourselves in Portugal, by 2015, 
you begin to see the continuation and the final result of this return of the spherical 
container of love or Da into the human experience, as the matrix inside the human mind 
continues to collapse, and the expression from it continues to revert more and more to the 
original Honomeia perspective, or what you would call ‘the Lemurian perspective’, for 
instance. 


And, therefore, in this period, you see the return of the information from Merkaia, or the 
Flower of Life, who begins to address humanity about the return of the Flower of Life grid, 
which, ultimately, is a grid of creative energy that taps straight into the creator self and 
bypasses the entire ego-mind-personality construct. Again something that is already 
available, and definitely by that point. 


And interestingly, also around that point - and this is where it gets truly interesting for 
today, as it were - also around that point, you have the information of Solarys that comes 
in, in the form of a class titled ‘The Three Year Renewal’. And I know it feels to some of us 
as though it should have been titled ‘The Thirty Year Renewal’, and to an even smaller 
group perhaps, it feels like it should have been titled ‘The Three Hundred Year Renewal’ 
because to many of us, that period between 2015 and today, 2022, has, indeed, done a lot 
for our external beauty and rest… as it has been, for many, and for Earth itself, and 
humanity collectively, quite a doozy of a number of years. 
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Reality Spheres

But in that point of time in 2015, Da Solarys San begins to introduce people to the concept, 
if you remember, of reality spheres. And she says that at this point in time, the collective 
human experience has now degraded from the gridlock it was in, initially, still in 2007, 
2008, and 2009, to a point where she announced really - as she was collectively sharing 
this information to all of humanity - that rather than a collective reality experience, a 
collective reality field, we would begin to see a more shattered field. And shattered 
meaning not so much that it would be destroyed or broken, that reality would cease to 
exist. No, more shattered in the sense that it would splinter down into separate reality 
spheres. 


This is what she announced in 2015. And she explained in that class very clearly that 
these reality spheres would be made up of the belief systems that people still hadn’t 
cleared, belief systems that go all the way down into the ego-mind-personality construct 
and the vibrational habits that humans have built up over the expression of various 
lifetimes. 


And this is an interesting point because at this point, you see the beginning of what, 
ultimately, still is playing out today in 2022. 


These reality spheres, as they started to move apart, started to truly separate people, 
initially, in ways that humanity has never seen before. And it was the quiet number of years 
after that until the true effects would be seen. 


But if we move on from 2015 for a second and Merkaia and Solarys there to 2016 - the 
end of 2015, the beginning of 2016 - then you see that the Imzaia Material presented 
something called ‘The Solar Activations’. And in those classes, myself but also others that 
came in, such as the solar Sun and some of the various planetary bodies of this solar 
system, began to teach you about the even larger and vaster effects that your mind has, 
not only on the Earth expression of reality, but also, of course, on the vaster reality that is 
beyond it. One thing I remember from one of those early classes is talking about the fact 
that any thought you even choose to express, eventually makes a dent, if you will, in the 
magnetic field of the Sun, which then, in its own right, reflects reality back to you, which 
will then adhere to what you believe. 


So, if you, in other words, in that moment in time still believe in the matrix based, 
vibrational 3D state of locked down human limited reality (sorry to say it in so many 
words), then, of course, what you believe is what you get, you know. That is, ultimately, 
what was taught in that moment in time. 
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And, of course, going far back into the early Imzaia Material, all of these pieces, as it is a 
holographic source of information, were constantly available throughout the entire material. 


I am telling you a lot of this to get to a point where we are today, but also to invite you, as 
we return the material back online, to go through it and to see, to find these points for 
yourself and to perhaps chronicle a little bit what these events have done to you as a 
human being, but also to you as an expresser of reality and, ultimately, as a creator self. 


So, as we go to this period of the Solar Activations, where, ultimately, a lot of information is 
shared about the truth and the true workings and the nature of this particular Ekaraia that 
you find yourselves in, this reality that you find yourselves in, we move on to 2017 and the 
beginning of 2018, where the Study of Vibration, as it has been known - everything that 
has been presented until that time - to some extent comes to a close as a chapter. 


The Twelfth Vibration

Because at that point, the entire vibrational reality that is around you had reached a point 
of what, initially, was labeled ‘the 12th vibration’, a state that is, ultimately, also described in 
the Mayan Calendar, Carl Calleman’s work. He describes it as ‘the 9th wave of 
consciousness’ because he looks at the waves of consciousness, while we describe it from 
a vibrational perspective, which has 12 vibrations and 144 frequencies within this universe, 
which is why we call it ‘the 12th vibration’. It is a state where everything that has ever come 
before becomes possible, and everything that one can possibly imagine becomes 
possible. 


In other words, as Carl Calleman would describe it, humanity gets access to all waves of 
human consciousness, from the lowest ones to the highest ones. And as we would 
describe it: your reality perspective is now at a complete 144 frequencies accessible to you 
and completely based on what you are creating within yourself. 


We then get to the Study of the Pah, which I begin introducing in 2017 and 2018 here 
mainly, initially, to the direct students and, ultimately, on websites, such as this one, and in 
classes, such as this one. 


As we get to that point, you can see the work making a great shift into reality creation and 
active ingredients of reality creation and, ultimately, the understanding of the inner being, 
the inner self, the creator of all that is around. 


Now, eventually, we come to the years 2019, 2020, 2021, and 2022. In this moment in time 
you are seeing a massive… some would call it ‘a massive counter attack’, a locking down 
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of external reality. And many would describe this from a concept of villains and heroes and 
victims. But, ultimately, that is not what it was about. The reason, ultimately, that these 
years in human history that you have experienced have happened, is because, much like 
the bird that is getting ready to fly after months and months - in your case lifetimes and 
lifetimes, in a way - in the so-called ‘nest, first in the egg, then in the nest - at some point 
gets pushed out of that nest and must fly. 


And as humanity came close to collectively doing so in those years, it retreated and 
created what it knew as the control system all over again in ways that many of you have 
never even considered possible in your lifetime. Maybe you heard of it in faraway lands, 
but never in your direct experience. So, this is a type of collective fear that has played out. 


But now, we have come to 2022 and beyond, and even though you see old systems 
shatter and at war with one another, duality literally battling itself out on the world stage 
once again, I am here to tell you today, in this class after this long expression of Imzaia 
history, if you will, that it is up to you to take upon yourself the responsibility of a creator, 
and from within that responsibility to understand that your mind and the systems that are 
still running within that mind - and to some extent some more subconscious elements of 
the self, but let’s not go into that today - is, ultimately, what is creating your reality second 
by second, and everything that you see outside of you collectively and individually as well. 


And you have now come to the point to be ready to leave this so-called ‘vibrational nest’. 
And this does not mean that you leave this universe, or you leave this reality. Far from it. It 
means that you are ready to step into a much more true-full, truthful version of it. 


But in order to do so - and this is, ultimately, what this ascension study is about - it is time 
for you to, on a very practical level, learn to work with this material and also, to learn to 
work with yourself, to truly get to a place of, not understanding, but compassion and love 
for the self and for the other and, ultimately, for the whole. And in the coming time, as we 
proceed with these classes, that is exactly what we are going to do because the only thing 
that is truly stopping you from taking any of these steps and changing literally the reality 
that is around you as a creator, is your own mind that is in the way. 


I have explained to you how the years have prepared you mostly from within, and with 
regular and sometimes not so regular guidance on the outside from us and others, but how 
the years have prepared you to step into this new version, this true version of yourself, a 
version that is literally based on Love, on Joy, on Freedom, on Truth, on Life, on Gratitude, 
on Grace, and on Wellbeing, and at that point even will manifest its own expressions of 
active reality creation. 


In previous classes, we have been preparing you by giving you information about, for 
instance, Hono’lyn’vah, White Space Training. We have spoken to you about KiRi, the 
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pineal gland technique for accessing this white space training. Teachers have come in in 
the form of Solarys who taught you recently, or introduced you at least to ‘The Art of Portal 
Travel’, as she calls it. She will be back next class after this one, next week in other words, 
to continue with that practice in a class called, not called ‘The Art’, but ‘The Heart of Portal 
Travel’. It is going to be brilliant, and it is going to take what we are talking about here 
today into a whole new level for yourself of understanding and experience mainly. 


But enough about that. 


A Missing Key Ingredient 

But we are going to be taking, as I already said, all of these things, and we are going to 
turn them into something practical. 


Many of you that have been working with the material might find themselves at this point - 
sometimes and sometimes not, but some might - find themselves slightly frustrated or 
even puzzled because they might feel that on the inside, within their true being, they have 
so much of all of this going on and so much creative power and so much manifestational 
power, and yet, the external reality, as I have explained already, doesn’t seem to be 
functioning that way. 


Now, even with the preparation of White Space Training and other things that we have 
prepared you for, such as Eja’i Chi Pah training in the coming time, the reason why these 
things have felt slightly difficult to achieve is because you are still missing a key ingredient. 
And today, we are going to be presenting that key ingredient to you. 


Because, as I had explained everything that happened over the last 15 years or so, you 
can see it as a movement of an infinity sign. If you look at the beginning point of 2007, for 
instance, you can see the movement going this way and, ultimately, making its way back 
to the center point, each time when one of these big events happened to yourself over and 
over again, making that movement. And once again, it is time for one of these movements 
to lead to the expression that lies beyond it. 


If you can, indeed, truly understand what I have been saying in this class so far and in 
previous classes, then not only can you come to the conclusion and the realization, and 
also the joyful celebration might I add, of the fact that this reality can be, indeed, and is, 
indeed, fluid and that it is, indeed, guided by these instruments, such as Da, Ba, Va, and 
Ra, and onward, if you can come to the acceptance of all of these things and if you can 
understand that the entire time you have been creating these realities, including this one, 
using the technique known as ‘mind’, the technique known as ‘sahvok’, then, ultimately, 
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you can come to the realization that this is not only true for, as we have taught in the Study 
of Vibration, your external reality, your world, and later on in the Study of Vibration, your 
entire solar system and your galaxy, but much more importantly maybe even, this then 
also holds true for yourself, for your beingness, your expression of beingness through 
mind, ego, and personality, and even for your physical self, your body. And that is exactly 
what I want to address here today. 


You have been led down many paths over your education in the schooling system on 
Earth. And some of you went to high school; others went to universities and did all sorts of 
studies. You have been led down many, many different paths, especially those of you who 
stepped into the world of science. Science is, ultimately, nothing more but the mirroring 
effect of that, which the scientist is actually looking for and not necessarily ending up with 
results that he or she wants to see, but the results that he or she believes, subconsciously 
mostly, to be there already. That is science. And, therefore, science, eventually, as any 
type of cult or culture does, goes deeper and deeper and deeper into its own perspectives. 
Biology, cosmology, all of these things, looking deeper and deeper and deeper, defining 
more and more the body in a biological way, an organic way, and, ultimately, an atomic 
and electronic way even. 


And while this is as good as any other model to create a body from or to run a reality on 
when it comes to duality, it certainly is not a model that can work for unity. And, therefore, 
within your mind, it might be time to take a step back. To take a step back from everything 
that you are aware and even less aware as the years go on, that you have learned in this 
life, that you have learned in school, that you have learned from peers around you, from 
television, from governments, all of these things, to take a step back and to see that they 
all were created, using the same base ingredients, active ingredients of reality creation. 


As I said at the beginning of this class, anything that presents itself as differently to it, is 
simply inverted geometry that can be unpacked, unwrapped, and within, the gift of Love or 
Joy or all of these things are within, are present again. All you have to do is look. All you 
have to do is not being focused on drama. Wanting to go down the path of egoic, dramatic 
tendencies, of course, will lead you to these more general, more collective realities. As I 
said before, even though humanity is no longer gridlocked as personalities in some sort of 
suspended animation, inside of the self, inside of the mind, many are still recreating 
exactly those realities. 


But to come back to the point, to come back to the point of science and biology and the 
body, many of you, if not all of you, will know of the concept of DNA, DNA that, ultimately, 
manifests, unfolds the body in the physical form it finds itself in. 


Now, this DNA is, ultimately, as your teachers have told you… Everybody will know the 
letters A, T, C, and G, as letters that make up your DNA in bases and bonds of these 
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bases to create either what ends up looking like you or what ends up looking like a 
banana. As your science teaches you, there is very little difference. In that respect, they 
are, indeed, correct. There is very little difference. 


But what happens when evolution occurs, and science even will be able to look deeper 
and deeper and deeper? At some point, the limit was the atomic, the electron, and the 
quantum. We have always told you over the years that if humanity will keep looking into 
the smaller and smaller and smaller quantum pockets of reality, eventually, as we go back 
through this infinity movement that continues to occur with everything at any point in time, 
eventually, the smaller becomes the larger, and the focus becomes not the quantum but 
the plethoric, the largest, the vast realities. 


Light Body DNA

And when these vast realities will be understood for what they are, then humanity will 
realize that these are, indeed, the building blocks of reality creation, that these vast 
realities that make up even the smallest quantum particle, are, ultimately, Da, Ba, Va, Ra, 
Ka, and so on. Love, Joy, Freedom, Truth, Life, and so on. 


So, if this is true, or if you can at least conceive of this as potentially true in this moment for 
yourself, then can you allow yourself the simplification perhaps to open your mind up to the 
fact that even your DNA is, ultimately, based on Da, Ba, Va, and Ra, Love, Joy, Freedom, 
Truth, and Life, Ka? Even this.


And if that is true, beloveds, if you can accept that notion for even a minute, if you can hold 
this in your heart for even a minute, then you will begin to see what I am talking about, and 
you will begin to realize that as we go forward with these exercises, it is going to be up to 
you to weave your world and to weave your body, to weave yourself into a new 
expression. Much like a chrysalis, much like a cocoon, ultimately, releases a butterfly, you 
have the power within your mind in this infinite moment of potential, even right now, to 
begin the reweaving of the biological DNA into the San based DNA, from A, T, C, and G to 
Da, Ba, Va, and Ra as new bond bases of your DNA structure, ultimately held together in 
the DNA spiral by the element of Ka, the life force. 


Now, put that in your DNA and eat it, I would say! Try with all of your heart to believe that 
you have the ability to transform your most fundamentally understood, on the mental level 
at least, parts of yourself into these building blocks, and you will achieve, even though this 
sounds like a big word perhaps, but you will achieve what has been called in the past ‘the 
light body’, also known as ‘the rainbow body.’ A body that in the vibrational reality will still 
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express biologically, but which truly is run on a tonal level, not vibrational, on a San based 
level. 


It is this activation of the light body that in the next class with Solarys, and going forward 
with myself and others as well, we will work with you on. This is a process, of course, that 
is unique to you, and that you can work on within yourself. But as the Imzaia Material 
tradition allows, we will continue to support you in the form of these classes, as you find 
your way through this massive shift to Da-Ba-Va-Ra DNA, or light body DNA. 


So, that is what all of this, going back to 2007, and even before that, 2005, with the start of 
the Family of Light teachings and the Source Material and, ultimately, the arrival of the 
Cosmic Twelve and the Cosmic Manifest and everything that came after that, was, 
ultimately, leading to. 


It has, of course, always been explained from the very beginning, but to remind you of this 
today, to re-heart you of this today I feel is the best use of our time in this moment because 
when truly applied, when truly contemplated, it is the true gift of freedom from the 
restricted concept of the self in a service to self based lock to the awesome and ever 
expanding concept of the self into the whole in service to other and service to whole based 
expression. 


In other words, you choosing to take these steps, as you have done in many cases for 
many years, or even if you are only taking them consciously for the past five minutes, I 
guarantee you that you have always been taking these steps because this is what this 
entire Ekaraia, ultimately, is about. As you do so, please know you don’t do any of these 
things initially for the self because the transformation that I am talking about will leap out of 
you in the form of Love and Joy and will inspire many others to do so. 


And then it is up to you to find your ways to do so. Do so through any expression that you 
can think of, anything that is close to your heart and your being. For some, this will be on a 
world stage; for others this will be on a kitchen stage. It doesn’t matter. All that matters is 
that the transformation occurs because remember the truth of this reality. What you see 
around you is your expressed Merkabah, and that is the same that the person on the world 
stage or the person in the kitchen sees. Only the translation is different when the 
translation is vibrational, and especially, as you have come to learn in recent years, when 
the vibrational expression is 12th vibrational. This is the chaos in which you as a species 
currently find yourself, and I , too, because I am here with you all the time. 


But from this chaos, this chaotic spectacular, if you will, a Vah, an approach to Pah, to a 
true heart based reality can occur, and it begins with you, beloved human. 
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So, having introduced you to these concepts of light body based, San based DNA, and 
having taken you through this little overview, I feel the time has come to leave you with 
these words, so that we can pick up once again next week where we left off. And, of 
course, for you to know that I am here, would you like to reach out at any time. If you have 
questions with regards to this, if you are working with this exercise at the beginning of the 
class or if you are working with the light body based DNA, then I am here and on the 
website to answer all of your questions. 


But out of that complexity of all of these words, I would like to close down in simplicity 
today by mentioning the following. And with this thought I would like to leave you: 


“I thrive when what I love, who I love, and what I am are one.” 


Thank you for your attention and focus in this moment. I will see you next week. 


Da ohami vish’ka san imzaia’e. 


Honomeia. 


SOTP020 - Final online edition for Imzaia.World  of 15 15 Final online edition for Imzaia.World - SOTP020


